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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 

  
INNOVATIVE HEALTHCARE SOLUTIONS, INC. RECEIVES MODERN 

HEALTHCARE’S BEST PLACES TO WORK IN HEALTHCARE 

 
Punta Gorda, FL, August 15, 2013 - Innovative Healthcare Solutions, Inc. (IHS), a provider of 
healthcare information technology consulting services, announced today that it has been 
selected as one of Modern Healthcare’s Best Places to Work in Healthcare for 2013. 
  
IHS's ranking, will be published in the October 28, 2013 issue of Modern Healthcare. The 2013 
event to celebrate the winners will be held October 24, 2013 in Atlanta at the Hyatt Regency 
Atlanta.  
 

About Innovative Healthcare Solutions, Inc. 
 
Innovative Healthcare Solutions, Inc. (IHS) is a healthcare information systems consulting firm 
with a cost-effective, proven approach that guides and assists healthcare organizations in 
planning, implementing and managing information systems and services. Our guiding principles 
Do What’s Best for our Clients, Do What’s Best for our Consultants and Never Forget the Patient 
has attributed to our superior 13 year reputation.  
 
“This award reflects the quality of our consultants and their dedication to our customers.  We 
strive to provide a culture that attracts great consultants, focused on providing great service to 
our customers and their patients”, said IHS Principals, Pat Stewart and Robin Bayne. “We are 
committed to supporting our consultants and we thank them for their commitment and loyalty 
to our company and customers” Stewart added. 
 
IHS provides our employees with an environment promoting continuing education, colleague 
knowledge sharing, easy access to management and first-rate employee benefits. Weekly 
communication in addition to day-to-day communications, our annual employee retreat, and 
Employee Development and Excellence Programs reinforces our commitment to our team 
members and a flourishing work environment. These programs and practices guarantee 
consistent, quality services. 
 
For more on Modern Healthcare’s Best Places to Work in Healthcare program, visit: 
http://www.modernhealthcare.com/article/20130814/INFO/308149999/modern-healthcares-
2013-best-places-to-work-in-healthcare 

http://www.modernhealthcare.com/article/20130814/INFO/308149999/modern-healthcares-2013-best-places-to-work-in-healthcare
http://www.modernhealthcare.com/article/20130814/INFO/308149999/modern-healthcares-2013-best-places-to-work-in-healthcare


About Modern Healthcare 

Modern Healthcare is the industry's leading source of healthcare business and policy news, 
research and information. Modern Healthcare reports on important healthcare events and 
trends, as they happen, through weekly print magazine, websites, e-newsletters, mobile 
products and events. Readers use information to make informed business decisions and lead 
their organizations to success. It's for this reason that Modern Healthcare magazine is ranked 
No. 1 in readership among healthcare executives and deemed a "must-read" by the who's who 
in healthcare. 

Modern Healthcare leads the market in editorial excellence and is honored to receive awards 
from ASBPE, ASHPE American Business Media, Trade Association and Business Publications 
International and the Association of Health Care Journalists, affirming Modern Healthcare's 
status as the best source for healthcare business and policy news, research and information. 

Each year this program singles out and recognizes outstanding employers in the healthcare 
industry on a national level. The program collects information from both the employer and 
employees and is open to all companies (providers, suppliers, payers) with at least 25 
employees. Employers complete a survey detailing the company policies and practices, benefits, 
and demographics. Employees are asked an in-depth set of questions that result in an analysis 
in 8 core areas including Leadership and Planning, Culture and Communications, Role 
Satisfaction, Training and Development, Pay and Benefits, Working Environment, Relationship 
with Supervisor, and Role Satisfaction. 
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